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Warning!           1 Timothy 1:3-11 

1. Perversion of truth is what Paul _FOUGHT_ against, 
wrote against and counseled Timothy and Titus and many 
others to stand firm against.  He instructed them to do so 
with the love of Christ.   
 

2.  Relative truth is the _MARK_ of our post-modern society.  
The most prized virtue of our society has become tolerance. 
 

3. “The aim of our charge is _LOVE__ that issues from a 
pure heart and a good conscience and a sincere faith.”   
1 Timothy 1:5  
 

4.  “If anyone teaches a different doctrine and does not 
_AGREE_ with the sound words of our Lord Jesus Christ 
and the teaching that accords with godliness, he is puffed up 
with conceit and understands nothing.”  1 Timothy 3:4a 
 

5.  Timothy is to stop the false teachers from devoting 
themselves “to myths and endless genealogies, which 
__PROMOTE__ speculations rather than the stewardship 
from God that is by faith.”  ! Timothy 1:4 
 

6. False teaching has two consequences.  First, false 
teaching obstructs faith and love of Christ.  Second, false 
teaching promotes controversies through __MYTHS_ and 
genealogies.  
 

7.  The decisive criteria to determine if a teaching is _TRUE_ 
is to determine if it promotes the glory of God and if it 
benefits His church.  
 

8. If people could be trusted to respect one other’s rights, 
there would be no need for __LAWS_ to safeguard them. 
 

9. “You shall not take the name of the LORD your God in 
vain, for the LORD will not hold him _GUILTLESS_ who 
takes his name in vain.”  Exodus 20:7 
 

10. Paul, a New Testament writer, says that to violate the 
Ten Commandments of the Old Testament is also a violation 
of the _GOSPEL__ of Jesus Christ.   
 

11.  Before salvation the _LAW__ condemns.    
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